BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 8 — Highway Traffic Signs - Aluminum Blanks

BLANKS Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
48" x 24" $27.65 $24.96
36" x 36" $31.10 $28.08
36" x 30" $25.92 $23.40
36" x 12" $11.23 $9.75
30" x 30" $21.60 $19.50
24" x 30" $17.28 $15.60
24" x 18" $10.37 $9.75
18" x 18" $8.42 $7.31
12" x 18" $6.05 $4.88
12" x 12" $4.90 $3.25
18" x 6" $3.98 S2.44
36" x 9" $8.42 $7.31
30" x 9" $7.04 $6.09
24" x 9" $5.62 $4.76
36" x 6" $6.83 $7.31
30" x 6" $6.13 $3.96
24" x 6" $4.90 $3.25
60" x 18" $25.92 $23.40
60" x 24" $34.56 $31.20
48" x 18" $20.74 $18.72
48"x 24" $27.65 $24.96
36" x 18" $15.55 $14.04
30" x 18" $12.96 $11.70
STOP BLANKS Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 36" $31.10 $28.19
30" x 30" $21.60 $19.50
ROUND BLANKS - . - .
R.R. ADVANCE Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" $31.10 $28.08
36"x48"x48" $25.20 $39.00




BID TABULATION

Proposal No. 9 — Highway Traffic Signs

Series 3930 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
12" x 36" $5.64 $4.50
24" x 42" $10.83 $10.43
30" x 30" $9.67 $9.31
12" x 18" $3.82 $2.25
30" x 36" $11.60 $11.18
30" x 18" $6.40 $5.63
48" x 24" $12.38 $11.92
30" STOPS $9.67 $9.31
36" STOPS $13.93 $13.41
24" x 30" $8.24 $7.40
24" x 24" $6.94 $6.00
24" x 18" S5.64 $4.50
12" x 12" $3.55 $1.50

18" x 6" $2.91 $1.13
48" x 30" $15.47 $14.90
36" x 36" $13.93 $13.41

Series 3930 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" x 30" $9.67 $9.31
36" x 36" $13.93 $13.41
24" x 24" $6.84 $6.00
24" x 30" $8.04 $7.50
12" x 18" $3.82 $2.25
30" x 36" $11.60 $11.18
30" x 18" $6.50 $5.63

36" STOP AHEAD $19.34 $18.45
36" SIGNAL AHEAD $19.34 $18.45
36" x 48" x 48" NO

$18.25 $18.00

PASSING ZONE
48" x 24" $12.38 $11.92
12" x 36" $5.64 $4.50
24" x 18" S5.64 $4.50




24" x 42" $10.83 $10.43
12" x 12" $3.55 $1.50
18" x 6" $2.91 $1.13
48" x 30" $15.47 $14.90
36" YIELD AHEAD $19.34 $18.45
36" ROUND $13.93 $13.41
30" x 12" $5.12 $3.75
Series 4084 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" DIAMOND $19.84 $19.50
48" DIAMOND $76.67 $50.14
48" x 18" $19.04 $18.72
36" DIAMOND $28.57 $28.08
30" x 24" $15.87 $15.60
Series 4083 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" SCHOOL $56.89 $57.60
36" DIAMOND $56.89 $57.60

Proposal No. 9 — Highway Traffic Signs

Series 3930 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
24" x 6" $7.25 $6.95
30" x 6" $8.63 $8.69
36" x6" $10.36 $10.43
24" x 9" $10.36 $10.43
30" x 9" $12.98 $13.03
36" x 9" $15.53 $15.64
Series 4083 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries

Face Size

Price Per Face

Price Per Face




36" Diamond $27.62 $27.72
30" x 12" $7.82 $7.88
30" x 18" $11.51 $11.55
24" x 8" $5.11 $4.20
24" x 12" $6.64 $6.30
Series 4000 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
30" STOP $54.97 $40.00
36" STOP $79.15 $57.60
Series 4000 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" STOP $56.89 $57.60
30" STOP $42.98 $40.00
36" YIELD $30.95 $59.85
18" x 6" ALL-WAY $6.16 $4.80
Series 3930 Dornbos Sign Co. Michigan State Industries
Face Size Price Per Face Price Per Face
36" x 48" x 48"
$44.02 $60.00
PASSING ZONE
36" ROUND ADVANCE
$48.21 $44.10

RAILROAD




BID TABULATION:

Proposal #11 - Metal Culvert Pipe and Bands

lensen Bridge & Supply Co.

Item #1 Dl::teeter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
CMP
12" $ 875|$ 1046 | $ 14.64 No Bid No Bid No Bid
15" S 1076 | S 1350 | $ 16.44 No Bid No Bid No Bid
18" $ 1299 | $ 1599 | $ 22.15 No Bid No Bid No Bid
21" S 1484 | S 18.60 | S 25.08 No Bid No Bid No Bid
24" $ 16.80 | $ 21.06 | $ 30.35 No Bid No Bid No Bid
30" S 2498 | S 2798 | S 3520 | S 49.92 No Bid No Bid
36" $ 27.95 | $ 3384 | S 43.15 | $ 60.89 No Bid No Bid
42" S 3275 $ 39.67 | S 54.73 | $ 71.04 No Bid No Bid
48" $ 40.39 | $ 4881 | $ 62.71| S 8151 $ 97.29 No Bid
54" S 4873 | $ 58.01 | S 7352 | S 9631 [ $ 112.92 No Bid
Bands 12" through 24" are 12"
wide
Bands 30" and above are 24" wide
Cadillac Culvert, Inc.
" Plpe 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge Bands
Item #1 Diameter
cMP
12" $8.58 $10.05 $13.45 No Bid No Bid $13.00 (12")
15" $10.68 $12.49 $16.97 No Bid No Bid $16.00 (12")
18" $12.90 $15.11 $20.55 No Bid No Bid $20.00 (12")
21" $15.20 $17.75 $24.18 No Bid No Bid $24.00 (12")
24" $17.40 $20.40 $27.89 No Bid No Bid $30.00 (12")
30" $22.44 $25.25 $34.77 No Bid No Bid $68.00 (24")
36" $26.94 $30.44 $42.19 $53.35 No Bid $78.00 (24")
42" $31.43 $37.09 $49.21 $62.25 No Bid $98.00 (24")
48" $36.85 $43.00 $56.25 $74.14 No Bid $110.00 (24")
54" $42.00 $51.25 $63.29 $80.03 No Bid $118.00 (24")

Jensen Bridge & Supply Co.

Bands 12" through 24" are 12"
wide

Bands 30" and above are 24" wide
Lifting lugs: $75.00 each
(48" & 54" each)

$17.55 (12")

$21.60 (12")

$27.00 (12")

$32.40 (12")

$40.05 (12")

$91.80 (24")

$105.30 (24")

$120.00 (24")

$135.00 (24")

Item #2 Di:::ter 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge
Poly-coated CMP
12" $ 1263 | $ 1469 | $ 18.16 No Bid No Bid
15" $ 1562 | $ 1823 | $ 23.44 No Bid No Bid
18" $ 1869 | $ 2176 | $ 27.48 No Bid No Bid
21" $ 2164 | S 2527 | S 30.96 No Bid No Bid
24" $ 2470 | $ 28.80 | $ 37.53 No Bid No Bid
30" $ 3292|S 3841 | S 47.07 [ $ 63.50 No Bid
36" $ 3936 | $ 47.36 | S 57.04 | $ 81.09 No Bid
42" $ 4934 | S 58.11| S 7146 | S 95.73 No Bid
48" $ 59.44 | $ 68.96 | $ 8363 | $ 11955 No Bid
54" $ 70.60 | S 80.86 | S 97.25 | $ 137.94 No Bid
Cadillac Culvert, Inc.
Item #2 . Pipe 16 Gauge 14 Gauge 12 Gauge 10 Gauge 8 Gauge
Diameter
Poly-coated CMP
12" g 1163 | $ 1327 | $ 18.70 No Bid No Bid
15" 5 1447 | S 1649 | S 23.58 No Bid No Bid
18" 5 1748 | $ 19.95 | $ 28.56 No Bid No Bid
21" 5 2051 | S 2343 | S 33.61 No Bid No Bid
24" 8 23.58 | $ 26.93 | $ 38.77 No Bid No Bid
30" S 3040 | S 3335 | S 48.33 No Bid No Bid
36" 8 36.50 | 4018 | $ 58.64 No Bid No Bid
42" S 4259 | S 4896 | S 68.40 No Bid No Bid
48" 8 4993 | $ 56.76 | $ 78.19 No Bid No Bid
54" S 56.91 | S 67.65 | S 87.97 No Bid No Bid

$160.00 (24")

Lifting lugs:
$50.00 each



BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 14 - CST®© - Trap Rock

Chesaning Hemlock Saginaw Co. |Geddes Road Pit ] ] Chesaning Salt
Curtis Road Pit -
) . Garage - Garage - Road Garage - - ) Shed -
Bidder's Name ) ) ) . Material & ]
Material & Material & Material & Material & . Material &
] . ] ] Trucking .
Trucking Trucking Trucking Trucking Trucking
Fisher Transportation Co. $61.45 $59.09 $55.40 $56.50 $56.23 $61.45




BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 15— C S 2 Trap Rock & 29A Limestone 50/50 Blend

Bidder’s Name Burroughs North
Chesaning Garage $42.25
Hemlock Garage $S40.50
Saginaw Garage $39.00
Geddes Rd Pit $40.25
Curtis Rd Pit $39.75
Pick-up by SCRC $34.50
Albee Twp. $40.25
Birch Run Twp. $40.25
Blumfield Twp. $39.50
Brady Twp. $42.25
Brant Twp. $42.25
Bridgeport Twp. $39.25
Buena Vista Twp. $39.25
Carrollton Twp. $39.25
Chapin Twp. $44.00
Chesaning Twp. $42.25
Frankenmuth Twp. $39.95
Fremont Twp. S41.75
James Twp. $39.75
Jonesfield Twp. S41.75
Kochville Twp. $39.50
Lakefield Twp. $42.00
Maple Grove Twp. $41.25
Marion Twp. $42.75
Richland Twp. $42.50
Saginaw Twp. $40.00
St. Charles Twp. $40.50
Spaulding Twp. $39.50
Swan Creek Twp. $40.50
Taymouth Twp. $40.50
Thomas Twp. $40.00
Titt. Twp. $40.00
Zilwaukee Twp. $39.00




BID TABULATION:

Proposal #16 Crack Sealing

Bidder's Name

Route, Clean & Seal with Hot
Poured Rubber

Clean & Seal with Hot Poured
Rubber OVER BAND Method

Fahrner Asphalt Sealers $1.57/Ib $1.30/Ib
Scodeller Construction $1.90/Ib $1.50/Ib
Wolverine Sealcoating $1.25/Ib $1.175/Ib




BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 17- Bituminous Patching Materials (Cold Patch)

ltem No. 1 - Styrelf Emulsion Based CP-6

F.O.B. F.O.B.
i , F.O.B. Saginaw F.O.B. Chesaning
Bidder's Name County Hemlock
Storage Yard Storage Yard
Trucks Storage Yard
Ace-Saginaw Paving Co. $125.00 $126.82 $128.32 $130.32

Iltem 2 - Hot Mix Bituminous Materials Material No. 1100T (20AA)

F.O.B.
Bidders Name County
Trucks

Ace-Saginaw Paving Co. $79.50




BID TABULATION: Proposal No. 19- Asphalt Emulsions

Bidder's Name Michigan Paving and Materials
AMS Seal FOB Shipping Point 2.69/Gallon
(Alma, M1) § gallon

$3.59/Gallon F.0.B Saginaw CRC Tank




BID TABULATION:

Proposal #25 - CALCIUM MAGNESIUM CHLORIDE SOLUTION

SUMMER BRINE GRAVEL ROADS

WINTER BRINE WITH STORAGE TANKS

WINTER BRINE ONLY

. Storage Storage Storage Storage Sto.rage Storage Storage Storage Storage Sto.rage
% - Price per . R R R R Price - R R R R Price -
gallon Lead Time Price - Price - Price - Price - Chesaning Price - Price - Price - Price - Chesaning
. . lock e g [ ch . Hemlock P ddes Pi
Bidder Chesaning H g Pit ey g Pit TG
Michigan Chloride Note: This covers 7 Townships only (James,
Sales, LLC 28% Screzju'mg, of dtusz Jonesfield, Lakefield, Richland, Swan Creek,
b control services to be
0.19 0.19 0.19 0.19 0.19 0.19 0.19 0.19 . . i i i
0.19/Gal | finalized with MCS by $ $ $ $ $ S S S $0.19 $0.19  [&Thomas). Winter brine is $.19/Gal +
2/1/2025 $700/month for tank rental.
Note: Covers all 27 Townships and no
. A 26% additional charge for tanks.
Wilkinson Solutions 24 hours $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20 $0.20

0.20/Gal




BID TABULATION:

Proposal No. 26 — Crushed Limestone — 23A

Bidder’s Name Burroughs North Fisher Transportation Co.
Loading Point (Location)
F.O.B. Loading Point $19.00 No Bid
F.0.B. Saginaw Garage (4000 ton approx) $23.00 $32.29
F.0.B. Chesaning Garage (2000 ton approx) $26.25 $39.23
F.0.B. Hemlock Garage (2000 ton approx) $24.50 $36.75
F.0.B. Geddes Road Pit (2000 ton approx) $24.25 $33.65
F.0.B. Curtis Road Pit (2000 ton approx) $23.75 $33.34
F.0.B. Chesaning Salt Shed (2000 ton approx) $26.25 $39.23
F.0.B. Albee Twp. $24.25 $35.50
F.0.B. Birch Run Twp. $24.25 $35.22
F.0.B. Blumfield Twp. $23.50 $30.12
F.O.B. Brady Twp. $26.25 $40.35
F.0.B. Brant Twp. $26.25 $38.52
F.0.B. Bridgeport Twp. $23.25 $32.37
F.0.B. Buena Vista Twp. $23.25 $30.49
F.0.B. Carrollton Twp. $23.25 $29.52
F.0.B. Chapin Twp. $28.00 $41.77
F.0.B. Chesaning Twp. $26.25 $38.07
F.0.B. Frankenmuth Twp. $23.95 $33.96
F.0.B. Fremont Twp. $25.75 $36.53
F.0.B. James Twp. $23.75 $32.31
F.0.B. Jonesfield Twp. $25.75 $35.90
F.0.B. Kochville Twp. $23.50 $29.44
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $26.00 $38.18
F.0.B. Maple Grove Twp. $25.25 $36.36
F.0.B. Marion Twp. $26.75 $40.06
F.0.B. Richland Twp. $26.50 $34.59
F.0.B. Saginaw Twp. $24.00 $32.02
F.0.B. St. Charles Twp. $24.50 $36.93
F.0.B. Spaulding Twp. $23.50 $32.31
F.0.B. Swan Creek Twp. $24.50 $34.59
F.0.B. Taymouth Twp. $24.50 $34.30
F.0.B. Thomas Twp. $24.00 $32.31
F.0.B. Tittabawassee Twp. $24.00 $31.71
F.0.B. Zilwaukee Twp. $23.00 $29.57

Proposal No. 26 - Modified Crushed Limestone - 22A

Bidder’s Name Burroughs North Fisher Transportation Co.
Loading Point (Location)
F.0.B. Loading Point $19.00 No Bid
F.0.B. Saginaw Garage (4000 ton approx) $23.00 $32.29
F.0.B. Chesaning Garage (2000 ton approx) $26.25 $39.23
F.0.B. Hemlock Garage (2000 ton approx) $24.50 $36.75
F.0.B. Geddes Road Pit (2000 ton approx) $24.25 $33.65
F.0.B. Curtis Road Pit (2000 ton approx) $23.75 $33.34
F.0.B. Chesaning Salt Shed (2000 ton approx) $26.25 $39.23
F.0.B. Albee Twp. $24.25 $35.50
F.O.B. Birch Run Twp. $24.25 $35.22
F.0.B. Blumfield Twp. $23.50 $30.12
F.O.B. Brady Twp. $26.25 $40.35
F.O.B. Brant Twp. $26.25 $38.52
F.0.B. Bridgeport Twp. $23.25 $32.37
F.0.B. Buena Vista Twp. $23.25 $30.49
F.0.B. Carrollton Twp. $23.25 $29.52
F.0.B. Chapin Twp. $28.00 $41.77
F.0.B. Chesaning Twp. $26.25 $38.07




F.0.B. Frankenmuth Twp. $23.95 $33.96
F.0.B. Fremont Twp. $25.75 $36.53
F.0.B. James Twp. $23.75 $32.31
F.O.B. Jonesfield Twp. $25.75 $35.90
F.0.B. Kochville Twp. $23.50 $29.44
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $26.00 $38.18
F.0.B. Maple Grove Twp. $25.25 $36.36
F.0.B. Marion Twp. $26.75 $40.06
F.O.B. Richland Twp. $26.50 $34.59
F.0.B. Saginaw Twp. $24.00 $32.02
F.0.B. St. Charles Twp. $24.50 $36.93
F.0.B. Spaulding Twp. $23.50 $32.31
F.0.B. Swan Creek Twp. $24.50 $34.59
F.0.B. Taymouth Twp. $24.50 $34.30
F.0.B. Thomas Twp. $24.00 $32.31
F.O.B. Tittabawassee Twp. $24.00 $31.71
F.0.B. Zilwaukee Twp. $23.00 $29.57




BID TABULATION:
NO BIDS SUBMITTED FOR PROPOSAL #28
Item #1 -
+ 1,400,000 Ft. Yellow Line
as directed

Proposal No. 28 - Line Striping

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

Item #2 -
White Line as directed

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

Item #3 -
Yellow Regular Dry Solvent
(Fall quantities unknown)

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)

Item #4 -
White Regular Dry Solvent
(Fall quantities unknown)

Bidder's Name

Labor & Equipment
(price per foot)

*Paint & Beads
(price per foot)




BID TABULATION:

PROPOSAL NO. 36 - MODIFIED NATURAL GRAVEL 23A

BIDDER L&D Carey & Sons Fisher Transportation Co.
F.O.B. Loading Point No Bid No Bid
F.O.B. Saginaw Garage $25.20 $21.27
(1000 ton approx) ' .
F.0.B. Chesaning Garage
17.50 17.85
(1000 ton approx) > °
F.O.B. Hemlock Garage $18.55 $20.13
(1000 ton approx) ' '
F.0.B. Geddes Road Pit $22.05 $20.70
(1000 ton approx) ) .
F.0.B. Curtis Road Pit (1000 $23.50 $21.65
ton approx) ' .
F.0.B. Chesaning Salt Shed $17.45 $17.85
(1000 ton approx) ' '
F.O.B. Albee Twp $19.55 No Bid
F.O.B. Birch Run Twp $23.62 No Bid
F.0.B. Blumfield $25.49 No Bid
F.O.B. Brady Twp. $17.32 $19.20
F.O.B. Brant Twp. $17.95 $20.02
F.O.B. Bridgeport Twp. $23.40 No Bid
F.O.B. Buena Vista Twp. $25.50 No Bid
F.0.B. Chapin Twp. $15.98 $18.13
F.O.B. Chesaning Twp. $18.50 No Bid
F.O.B. Frankenmuth Twp. $23.72 No Bid
F.O.B. Fremont Twp. $19.20 $22.22
F.O.B. James Twp. $21.55 No Bid
F.O.B. Jonesfield Twp. $19.99 $21.72
F.O.B. Lakefield Twp. $18.50 $20.96
F.O.B. Maple Grove Twp. $20.13 No Bid
F.O.B. Marion Twp. $17.90 $20.65
F.0.B. Richland Twp. $20.50 $23.48
F.O.B. St. Charles Twp. $19.66 No Bid
F.0.B. Spaulding Twp. $22.83 No Bid
F.0.B. Swan Creek Twp. $20.23 No Bid
F.O.B. Taymouth Twp. $22.83 No Bid
F.O0.B. Thomas Twp. $22.25 No Bid
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